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Miscellaneous Topics 
 
MCI requested to be added to the TAG.  
 
Michael Timlin stated Greyhound would be adding a daily Denver to Grand Junction trip 
to their schedule. 
 
Amy Ostrander from the City of Black Hawk stated that the City recently developed a 
study analyzing the travel patterns and numbers of visitors to Black Hawk.  She said 
she would share the report with the CDOT and the I-70 TAG once it was complete. 
 
Tom Mauser and John Valerio of CDOT discussed whether or not Human Service was 
anticipated to be a fixed or flexible service and the issue of getting to one’s destination 
(the last mile) once the human service trip ends.  John responded with an example of 
Chaffee Shuttle service that operates from Salida to Pueblo on a fixed schedule, but 
then operates as demand response service within Pueblo once the vehicle arrives at 
Pueblo Transit Center. 
 
Tom Mauser didn’t think I-70 service considerations were addressing recreational 
needs.  The project team explained our approach to I-70 service to Mauser, in which the 
immediate focus is employment, human service transportation, and connectivity but in 
which visitor needs are considered for the medium and long-term options.  
 
There was a discussion about the need for wheelchair spots on vehicles and how 
service providers dealt with vehicle under-capacity issues. 
 
The project team and David Krutsinger described CDOT’s ongoing Advanced Guideway 
System Feasibility Study and how any AGS service would be considered in the long-
term planning efforts.  A question was asked about roadway improvements (Peak 
Period Shoulder running) and whether or similar issues would be considered in our 
study.  The team responded that on-going studies and improvements (e.g. Twin 
Tunnels) would be considered in our study. 
 
Brent Belisle, a member representing Denver Regional Mobility and Access Council 
(DRMAC), wanted more focus groups for I-70 service.  Suzanne O’Neill discussed the 
possibility of a public meeting, newsletter or at a minimum, making more people aware 
of the information provided on CDOT project website.  
 
Proposed I-70 Service Discussions 
 
Maribeth Lewis-Baker from the Town of Breckenridge wanted CDOT to be careful not to 
establish service that would compete with funds available for existing services, or 
compete with privately-operated airport to resort shuttles. 
 
David Johnson of RFTA took the discussion further to express his concern about limited 
Faster funds following CDOT’s proposed service.  Maribeth Lewis-Baker echoed Mr. 
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